HUNT COUNTY BID AWARD RFB #254-24, ROAD ROCK EFFECTIVE OCTOBER, 8, 2024 THRU OCTOBER 7, 2025

1,34" 1,34	2024-2025 Rock Bids & Pricing All Prices are per Ton	ricing							1 1/2" Odot	1 1/2" Odoł	1 1/2" Odo:	1 1/2" Odor		Туре В	Тур	0	
PRILOCATION Priest Blase 134f* Priest Blase	Codes: x-no bid								1 1/2" Odot	1 1/2" Odot	1 1/2" Odot	1 1/2" Odot			Type B	Туре В Туре В	+
Pit Location Pissed Up Present 1			1 3/4 "	1 3/4" Flex Base		1 3/4" Flex Base	1 3/4" Flex Base	1 1/2" Odot	Base A	Base A	Base A	Base A		Туре В	Type B Grade 3		Grade 3
PHLOCATION Pilead Up Precinct Precin			Flex Base	Delivered	+-+	Delivered	Delivered	Base A	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered		Grade 3		Delivered	Delivered Delivered
See below See below See below Section (type of Sumpyrate & Medimery:	Company	Pit Location	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4		Picked Up	Picked Up Precinct 1	-	Precinct 1
Coleman, OK \$12.00 X X X X X X X X X	Arcosa Crushed Concrete	See below	\$21.00 (Type D) **\$21.00/ton Sunnyvale & McKinney; \$20.00/ton Garland	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	×		×	×		×
Sking Company Wintesboro, TX \$10.25 \$30.00 \$34.25 \$36.00 \$32.25 X X X X X X X X X	Sun Mining	Coleman, OK	\$12.00	×	×	×	×	\$11.00	×	×	×	×	-	\$17.50	\$17.50 ×		×
Coleman Quarry \$13.50 X	Denton Trucking Company	Whitesboro, TX	\$10.25	\$30.00	\$34.25	\$36.00	\$32.25	×	×	×	×	×	ļ	×	×		×
C Dallas, TX X \$48.13 \$49.09 \$49.57 \$50.06 X \$52.84 \$53.90 \$54.43	Dolese Brothers Company	Coleman Quarry	\$13.50	×	×	×	×	\$11.80	×	×	×	×	-	×	×		×
C. Sawyer, OK 74756 \$13.00 \$35.31 \$38.53 \$36.92 \$32.09 X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X	Green Dream International, LLC.	Dallas, TX	×	\$48.13	\$49.09	\$49.57	\$50.06	×	\$52.84	\$53.90	\$54.43	54.95	-	×	× \$55.54		\$55.54
L-no bid Type B Type	RK Hall, LLC	244 OK-147, Sawyer, OK 74756	\$13.00	\$35.31	\$38.53	\$36.92	\$32.09	×	×	×	×	×		\$45.00	\$45.00 \$67.32		\$67.32
Type B Grade 4 Grade 4 <th< td=""><td>Codes: x-no bid</td><td></td><td></td><td>Туре В</td><td>Туре В</td><td>Туре В</td><td>Туре В</td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td><td></td></th<>	Codes: x-no bid			Туре В	Туре В	Туре В	Туре В										
Crusher run Cusher ru			Туре В	Grade 4	Grade 4	Grade 4	Grade 4	1 1/2"	1 1/2"	1 1/2"	1 1/2"	1 1/2"		2 1/2"	2 1/2" 2 1/2"		2 1/2"
Pit Location Precinct Preci			Grade 4	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered	Crusher run	Crusher run	Crusher run	Crusher run	Crusher run	+	Crusher run	-	Crusher run Crusher run	Crusher run Crusher run Crusher run
Coleman, OK \$17.50 X X X X X X X X X	Company Company	Pit Location	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Y romoner z	Y Precinct 3	Y X		X X	X X X	+	Y Y
king Company Whitesboro, TX X X X X X X \$30.55 \$37.25 Hers Company Coleman Quarry X	Sun Mining	Coleman, OK	\$17.50	×	× 2	×	×	\$11.00	×	×	×	×		\$11.00		×	×
ers Company Coleman Quarry x x x x x x x \$10.25 x x x x 1nthemetional, LLC. Dallas, TX x \$52.84 \$53.90 \$54.43 \$54.95 x \$52.84 \$53.90 \$54.43 \$54.43 \$54.95 x \$52.84 \$53.90 \$54.43 \$54.95 x \$54.95	enton Trucking Company	Whitesboro, TX	×	×	×	×	×	\$10.55	\$30.55	\$35.55	\$37.25	\$32.25		×		×	×
international, LLC. Dallas, TX x \$52.84 \$53.90 \$54.43 \$54.95 x \$52.84 \$53.90 \$54.43 244 OK-147, Sawyer, OK 74756 \$45.00 \$67.32 \$70.53 \$68.92 \$64.09 \$12.50 \$34.81 \$38.03 \$36.42	Dolese Brothers Company	Coleman Quarry	×	×	×	×	×	\$10.25	×	×	×	×		\$10.25			×
244 OK-147, Sawyer, OK 74756 \$45.00 \$67.32 \$70.53 \$68.92 \$64.09 \$12.50 \$34.81 \$38.03 \$36.42	Green Dream International, LLC.	Dallas, TX	×	\$52.84	\$53.90	\$54.43	\$54.95	×	\$52.84	\$53.90	\$54.43	\$54.95	Н	×	x \$71.69		\$71.69
	RK Hall, LLC	244 OK-147, Sawyer, OK 74756	\$45.00	\$67.32	\$70.53	\$68.92	\$64.09	\$12.50	\$34.81	\$38.03	\$36.42	\$31.59		×	×		×

RFB #254-24 Rock Bid Page 1 of 2

HUNT COUNTY BID TABULATION RFB #254-24, ROAD ROCK EFFECTIVE OCTOBER, 8, 2024 THRU OCTOBER 7, 2025

ACED-FORT INDEX DIGG OF	Sinair																
All Prices are per Ton																	
odos: v no hid																	
COURSE A TIO DIG		3/8"	"Q/ C	3/8"	3/8"	3/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	5/8"	3/4"
		#2 Cover (Chip	#2 Cover (Chip	#2 Cover (Chip	#2 Cover (Chip	#2 Cover (Chip	#3 Cover (Chip	#3 Cover	#3 Cover	#3 Cover	#3 Cover	#4 Cover (Chip	#4 Cover	er	/er	er	
		Rock)	Rock)	Rock)	Rock)	Rock)	Rock)	(Chip Rock)	(Chip Rock)	(Chip Rock)	(Chip Rock)	Rock)	(Chip Rock)	(Chip Rock) (0		Mill Run
Company	Pit Location	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3 P	Precinct 4 Pi	Picked Up
Arcosa Crushed Concrete	See below	×	×				×	×				×	×				×
Sun Mining	Coleman, OK	×	×				\$17.50	×				\$17.50	×				×
Denton Trucking Company	Whitesboro, TX	×	×				×	×				×	×				×
Dolese Brothers Company	Coleman Quarry	×	×				×	×				×	×				×
Green Dream International, LLC.	Dallas, TX	×	\$55.54	\$56.65	\$57.21	\$57.76	×	\$71.69	\$73.12	\$73.84	\$74.56	×	\$71.69	\$73.12	\$73.84	\$74.56	×
	244 OK-147,							,					ς.				<
NY Hall, LEC	Campai, Occidios	>	,				,	,				,	;				:
								18" & Larger	18" & Larger	18" & Larger	18" & Larger						
		12"	12" Riprap	12" Riprap	12" Riprap	12" Riprap	18" & Larger	Riprap	Riprap	Riprap	Riprap				<u> </u>		
		Riprap	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered	Riprap	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered	Delivered						
Company	Pit Location	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4	Picked Up	Precinct 1	Precinct 2	Precinct 3	Precinct 4						
Arcosa Crushed Concrete	See below	\$35.00	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	×						
Sun Mining	Coleman, OK	\$26.00	×	×	×	×	\$26.00	×	×	×	×						
Denton Trucking Company	Whitesboro, TX	×	\$54.00	\$60.00	\$62.00	\$58.00	×	\$57.00	\$65.00	\$67.00	\$63.00						
Dolese Brotners Company	Coleman Quarry	\$28.75	×	×	×	×	\$28.75	×	×	×	×						
Green Dream International, LLC.	Dallas, TX	×	\$80.16	\$81.76	\$82.56	\$83.37	×	\$81.70	\$83.33	\$84.15	\$84.97						
RK Hall, ILC	244 OK-147, Sawyer, OK 74756	\$45.00	\$72.16	\$76.08	\$74.12	\$68.24	\$45.00	\$72.16	\$76.08	\$74.12	\$68.24						
Arcosa Crushed Concrete also offers the following: 12" Riprap Picked Up: \$35.00 crushed concrete (Garland Plant) Recycled Asphalt Millings (RAP), so-land, McKinney & Sunnyvale Yards - Crushed Concrete Oversize Rock (3x5) \$28.00 per ton - Crushed Concrete 1: utility Rock \$28.00 per ton. 8"X12" Riprap-Garland Yard - Flex Base Garland, McKinney & Sunnyvale Yards - Crushed Concrete (Garland Plant) Recycled Asphalt Milling (RAP), so-land, McKinney & Sunnyvale Yards - Crushed Concrete (Garland Plant) Recycled Asphalt Millings (RAP) \$24.00 per ton - Crushed Concrete 1: utility Rock \$28.00 per ton. 8"X12" Riprap-Garland Yard - Flex Base Garland, McKinney & Sunnyvale Yard, 200 Lawson Road, Mesquite, TX 75089, McKinney Yard - 2540 E. University Dive, McKinney, TX 75069, Sunnyvale Yard, 200 Lawson Road, Mesquite, TX 75181	offers the following: 1: unnyvale Yards -Crushed C TERY IS INCLUDED ON AN	2" Riprap Picked Up: \$ oncrete Oversize Rock Y OF THE LISTED BIC	35.00 crushed concre (3x5) Garland, McKir	ite (Garland Plant) Re nney & Sunnyvale Ya	scycled Asphalt Milling rds - Crushed Concre	gs (RAP) \$24.00 per ste 1" utility Rock, Ga Y AND INVENTORY	ton - Crushed Concr	ete Oversize Rock irds: Garland Yard ED - FLEX BASE	(3x5) \$28.00 per - 3637 Castle Dri	ton - Crushed Co re, Rowlett, TX 75 ROM RECYCLE)	ncrete 1: utility Ro 089, McKinney Ya ', CRUSHED CON	ck \$28.00 per ton. 8 rd - 2540 E. Univer: CRETE - RECYCLE	"X12" RipRap-Ga sity Drive, McKinn ED ASPHALT MIL	rland Yard - Flex ey, TX 75069, Su LINGS (RAP)	Base Garland, N Innyvale Yard, 20	ncKinney & Sunr)0 Lawson Road	nyvale Yards - Re Mesquite, TX 75
Sun Mining also offers the following: 3/4" #67 Tx Dot #5 - \$15.50 per ton, 1" #57 TxDot #4 - \$15.00 per ton	wing: 3/4" #67 Tx Dot	#5 - \$15.50 per ton,		\$15.00 per ton			IS NOT GUARANTE										
Denton Trucking, Co. also offers the following: 1 1/2" Dolemite Crusher Run Delivered - Pct 1 - \$31.00 per ton	rs the following: 1 1/2"	:	1" #57 TxDot #4 -				II NOT GUARANTE										
Dolese Brothers Co. also offers the following: 1 1/2" Flex Base - Picked Up - \$13.50 per ton, 3" Surge - Pi+A59cked Up - \$11.80 per ton, Screening - P		Dolemite Crusher H	1"#57 TxDot #4 -	1 - \$31.00 per ton			IS NOT GUARANTE										
	the following: 1 1/2"	Plex Base - Picked	1"#57 TxDot #4 - Run Delivered - Pct I Up - \$13.50 per to	1 - \$31.00 per ton on, 3" Surge - Pi+	A59cked Up - \$11	.80 per ton, Scre	IS NOT GUARANTE	icked Up - \$9.70 per ton	3						_		